
45 Story Starters That Will Inspire
Getting started with writing can sometimes be the most challenging part of the
process. You find yourself staring at a blank page, waiting for that creative spark
to ignite. But fear not! We have compiled a list of 45 story starters that are
guaranteed to inspire you and kickstart your writing journey.

1. The old house stood at the end of the street, its windows boarded up and a
mystery surrounding it.

2. The sound of thunder echoed through the forest as she stumbled upon a
hidden treasure.
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3. He woke up to find himself in a world where everyone had disappeared
overnight.
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4. The tiny bookstore hidden in the alleyway held a secret collection of
spellbinding books.

5. The first snowfall of the year blanketed the city, uncovering a long-lost item of
importance.

6. They say the abandoned amusement park is haunted, but she decided to
venture inside.

7. As she peered into the mirror, her reflection started to speak to her, revealing a
shocking truth.

8. The sound of footsteps followed her every move, but every time she turned
around, nobody was there.

9. The clock struck midnight, and the statue in the park came to life.

10. A mysterious letter arrived in the mail, addressed to someone who didn't exist.

11. The old diary she found in the attic revealed a family secret that had been
hidden for generations.

12. The abandoned lighthouse on the cliff held the key to unlocking a forgotten
legend.

13. In a world where dreams became reality, he discovered the power of his own
imagination.

14. The sun disappeared one day, plunging the world into darkness and chaos.



15. She stumbled upon a hidden door in her basement and stepped into a parallel
universe.

16. The antique shopkeeper possessed the ability to grant wishes, but at a great
cost.

17. The sound of laughter echoed through the abandoned school, even though
no one was there.

18. The sight of a shooting star led her on a journey to find her true purpose in
life.

19. The old photograph she found in her grandmother's attic held a clue to a long-
lost treasure.

20. The magical looking glass she inherited revealed a world beyond her wildest
dreams.

21. The abandoned subway tunnel held a secret passageway to another
dimension.

22. The fortune teller predicted a life-changing event, and shortly after, her world
turned upside down.

23. The melody of an old music box transported her to a time long forgotten.

24. The mysterious fog rolled in, bringing with it a discovery that would change
everything.

25. The hidden garden behind her new home held a connection to her past life.



26. The whispers in the wind led her to a hidden society living among humans.

27. The abandoned toy factory suddenly came back to life, creating mischief in
the town.

28. The magical pen she discovered had the power to bring her drawings to life.

29. The forgotten library in the middle of the forest held books that could rewrite
history.

30. The voice inside his head turned out to be a guardian angel guiding him
through life.

31. The crumbling castle on the hill held a secret room that no one had ever
entered.

32. The mysterious traveler she met on the train turned out to be from a different
time period.

33. The abandoned carnival came to life at night, with the spirits of performers
long gone.

34. The rain washed away her troubles and revealed a hidden path to happiness.

35. The map she stumbled upon led her on a quest to find a legendary treasure.

36. The magical tree in the middle of the forest granted wishes to those who truly
believed.

37. The forgotten painting in the attic unveiled a portal to a surreal world.

38. The mysterious ticking sound led her on a journey to uncover the truth.



39. The old neighborhood she grew up in had a secret night market only
accessible to a chosen few.

40. The abandoned ship held the key to solving a century-old maritime mystery.

41. The enchanted ring she found granted her the power to travel through time.

42. The secret cave behind the waterfall revealed an ancient civilization hidden
from the world.

43. The painting she created had the ability to change the emotions of those who
looked at it.

44. The haunted mansion on the hill held a ghostly secret waiting to be
uncovered.

45. The gentle breeze carried with it a message that could change the course of
her life forever.

Now that you have 45 exciting story starters, it's time to unleash your imagination
and dive into the world of storytelling. Whether you choose to continue these
stories or let them inspire new ones, these prompts are sure to get your creative
juices flowing. Happy writing!
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This book includes 45 story starters, organized into five genres, that will spark the
imaginations of students looking for a creative outlet. Each story starter is more
than just a simple prompt- they are an invitation for you to build upon the
groundwork provided for a unique plot and to give life to new characters.
Ages 10 and up.
All proceeds in 2020 and 2021 will go to Direct Relief to support the COVID-19
response.
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