
Bella's Big Caribbean Adventure: Join Bella
and her friends on an unforgettable journey
Have you ever dreamt of embarking on a thrilling adventure in the mesmerizing
Caribbean? Well, get ready to dive into the action-packed world of Bella and
Friends as they set off on Bella's Big Caribbean Adventure. Join Bella, a
courageous and adventurous young girl, along with her loyal animal companions,
as they discover the wonders of the Caribbean and face exhilarating challenges
along the way.



Setting Sail

The sun kissed beaches, crystal clear turquoise waters, and vibrant cultural
heritage of the Caribbean provide the perfect backdrop for this delightful and
heartwarming tale. Bella's journey begins as she embarks on a magnificent cruise
ship, ready to explore the wonders that lay ahead. Accompanied by her friends,
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including Max the courageous dog, Lola the mischievous parrot, and Tito the wise
turtle, Bella is all set to uncover the secrets of this tropical paradise.
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Uncovering Hidden Treasures

As Bella and her friends sail across the Caribbean Sea, their curiosity leads them
to numerous islands, each holding its own enchanting secrets. From lush
rainforests teeming with exotic wildlife to mysterious hidden caves, the group
encounters breathtaking landscapes and encounters remarkable characters
along the way. Be prepared to meet a wise old dolphin who possesses ancient
knowledge, a mischievous monkey who guides them through the dense jungle,
and even a legendary mermaid who holds the key to a hidden treasure!

Thrilling Adventures

Every corner of the Caribbean brings new and thrilling adventures for Bella and
her friends. From daring zip-lining through the canopies to exhilarating snorkeling
expeditions exploring vibrant coral reefs, the group is always on the lookout for
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excitement. Together, they conquer treacherous heights, overcome obstacles,
and learn invaluable lessons about teamwork, bravery, and friendship.

A Lesson in Cultural Diversity

The Caribbean is a melting pot of cultures, and Bella's Big Caribbean Adventure
celebrates this diversity. As the friends interact with the locals, they are
introduced to various traditions, music rhythms, and mouthwatering local cuisine.
From participating in a colorful carnival to learning traditional dance moves, Bella
and her friends cherish the rich tapestry of cultures that make the Caribbean truly
unique.

The Grand Finale

After an eventful journey filled with unforgettable experiences, Bella and her
friends approach the final destination of their Caribbean adventure. The
anticipation builds as they follow clues leading to the hidden treasure. Will they
find it? Join Bella and her friends on this captivating adventure to discover the
answer!

A Timeless Tale of Friendship and Discovery

Bella's Big Caribbean Adventure not only provides an exciting escapade but also
delivers valuable life lessons. It teaches young readers the importance of
friendship, exploring new horizons, and embracing diversity. The beautifully
illustrated pages transport readers to the vibrant and colorful landscapes of the
Caribbean, ensuring an immersive reading experience for all. Get ready to
embark on an unforgettable journey with Bella and Friends!
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FROM THE BACK COVER
School is out for the summer and Bella is off to St Vincent and the Grenadines
with her mum Isabel, Granny Sylta, Iris, and Tommy. This is not just any holiday,
because Bella and Iris are going to be bridesmaids at Clara’s wedding, her
mum’s best friend.

When Bella and the rest of the family arrive at Clara’s plush villa in Cane Garden,
she and Iris have the opportunity to view their dresses before the big day. The
dresses are locked up in a wardrobe that is so old not only does it take ten
minutes to open, but you can barely turn the lock.

But after a minor distraction, they miss the chance to view their dresses. Bella
and Iris must now wait another week before they can see them. Feeling incredibly
impatient, Bella sneaks the wardrobe key to finally have a peek at the dresses.
But when a ball sails over the garden wall, the unexpected happens and one silly
mistake changes everything and her Big Caribbean Adventure turns into
something she could never have imagined.
Bella’s Big Caribbean Adventure is a story about the importance of patience,
teamwork and never giving up.
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***REVIEWS***

"A delightful children's story that shines a light on St Vincent. Loved it!' Kenisha
Patrick, Primary School Teacher, St Vincent and the Grenadines.

"This mother and daughter duo is certainly one to watch." Sandra Bee, Actress &
TV Personality, Brothers and Sisters.

"A fun adventure story for children of all ages. The perfect cosy read with an
important lesson on patience too." Soulla Christodoulou, Private English Tutor,
and Author.

"An absolute page-turner that will be widely enjoyed by the 7-11 demographic. It
was a joy to follow every twist, turn, disappointment, and joy from start to finish. "
Leonie Jackson, Amazon reader.

"I would love to visit St Vincent after reading this cute story. Amazing!"
MARIBETH, founder of HeyTootsBalloons.

"I would have loved reading Bella’s Big Caribbean Adventure at aged 7-11 and
found myself quickly caught up in the story. This is a wonderfully paced story; it
has plenty of action moments and also some wonderful descriptive passages. A
fabulous story and one I would definitely recommend to younger readers who
love action, adventure stories." Yvonne at Me and MyBooks.

"Bella really is a likeable character, as are her friends Tommy and Iris. This is a
great adventure we go on across the Caribbean and one where I learned of some
delicious Caribbean foods." Grass Monster at Lost 815 Oceanic Book Blog
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