
The Commonwealth Of Oceana Annotated - A
Fascinating Dive into an Alternate Reality
What if history had taken a different turn? What if a utopian society, one never
seen before or since, had come into existence? In this article, we explore the
alternate reality presented in "The Commonwealth of Oceana" by James
Harrington, a visionary political thinker of the 17th century.

Published in 1656, "The Commonwealth of Oceana" is a remarkable work of
political philosophy. Harrington describes a fictional commonwealth set in the
newly discovered continent of Oceana, inhabited by an enlightened society that
epitomizes ideal governance.

The Creation of Oceana

Harrington paints a vivid picture of Oceana's genesis. In his alternate history, a
group of disillusioned Englishmen sets sail for a new land to escape the political
intrigues and societal inequalities of their time. They set up a revolutionary
political system that prioritizes equality, wealth distribution, and the well-being of
the citizens.
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A System of Government

Oceana's system of government, which Harrington refers to as a "Ballot-
Monarchy," is an innovative blend of aristocracy, monarchy, and democracy. This
equitably balances the power between the leaders and the people, ensuring
stability and prosperity for all.

The citizens of Oceana participate in a unique electoral system. The land is
divided into self-sufficient districts, each represented by a councilor, and they
elect a Senate. The head of state, called the "Lord Archon," is elected from the
Senate through a ballot system. This rotation of power prevents corruption and
creates a government that is truly representative of the will of the people.

Economic Equality

One of the most striking aspects of Oceana is its focus on economic equality.
According to Harrington, private property is essential, but so is its distribution.
Through a land redistribution program, every citizen is given an equal opportunity
to own and cultivate land, thereby ensuring food security and economic stability.

Social Structure and Education

Another intriguing aspect of Oceana is its unique social structure. Harrington
divides society into three classes: the nobility, the gentry, and the commonalty.
This classification is not hereditary, as it is in traditional aristocratic systems, but
is based on merit, intelligence, and education.

Education holds a crucial role in Oceana, with the state providing free education
to all its citizens, regardless of their social standing. This commitment to
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education fosters a knowledgeable society where the individual's abilities, rather
than their birthright, determine their place in the community.

Commonwealth vs. Monarchy

Harrington presents a scathing critique of traditional monarchies prevalent in the
17th century. He argues that the Commonwealth of Oceana offers a superior
alternative to such systems, with its emphasis on meritocracy and democratic
representation. In his view, a hereditary monarchy leads to corruption, nepotism,
and an imbalance of power.

Legacy and Influence

While "The Commonwealth of Oceana" never gained widespread popularity
during Harrington's lifetime, it had a significant impact on political thought in
subsequent centuries. Many elements of his proposed political system found
echoes in the later democratic movements, notably in the American and French
Revolutions.

"The Commonwealth of Oceana" is a thought-provoking piece that takes readers
on a captivating journey into an alternate reality. Through his innovative political
ideas, Harrington challenges the prevailing notions of governance and offers a
compelling vision of an egalitarian society. Though fictional, Oceana serves as a
shining example of what could be achieved through enlightened leadership and a
commitment to equality.

If you are interested in exploring the depths of political philosophy and imagining
a world where utopia exists, "The Commonwealth of Oceana" is a fascinating
read that will push the boundaries of your imagination and provoke thought on the
possibilities of a fairer and more just society.



So, why wait? Dive into this alternate reality today and let Harrington's vision
inspire you!
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Detailed Biography Of The Writer

The Commonwealth of Oceana, published 1656, is a work of political philosophy
by the English politician and essayist James Harrington. The unsuccessful first
attempt to publish Oceana was officially censored by Lord Protector Oliver
Cromwell. It was eventually published, with a dedication to Cromwell.
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