
The Imperialism of the Copy in Iranian and
Parsi Architecture
Architecture has always played a vital role in showcasing a society's culture,
history, and values. In the case of Iranian and Parsi architecture, the interplay
between originality and imitation has resulted in a fascinating blend of influences
from various civilizations. This article delves into the concept of "imperialism of
the copy" within Iranian and Parsi architecture, exploring how it has shaped these
unique architectural styles over time.

Understanding the Imperialism of the Copy

The imperialism of the copy refers to the phenomenon where a dominant
culture's architectural elements or styles are replicated and incorporated into the
designs of other cultures. This is often seen as a form of cultural domination,
where the original culture's architectural identity is undermined or subsumed
under the influence of the dominant one. In the case of Iranian and Parsi
architecture, this concept sheds light on the historical and cultural dynamics at
play.

Historical and Cultural Influences

Iranian architecture has a rich history dating back several centuries, with
influences from various civilizations such as the Persian, Byzantine, and Islamic
empires. Throughout history, Iran has been subjected to various forms of
occupation, invasions, and cultural exchanges. These external influences have
left a lasting impact on Iranian architecture, leading to a diverse amalgamation of
styles and motifs.
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Parsi architecture, on the other hand, emerged as a result of the Zoroastrian
Parsi community's migration from Iran to the Indian subcontinent. The Parsis
brought with them their unique architectural traditions and fused them with local
Indian styles to create a distinct architectural identity.

The Copy as a Symbol of Power

One aspect of the imperialism of the copy in Iranian and Parsi architecture is the
use of certain architectural features as symbols of power and prestige.
Throughout history, dominant cultures have often used their architectural styles to
assert their authority over conquered territories. This is evident in the architectural
copies found in Iranian and Parsi buildings, where elements from dominant
cultures were adopted to project a sense of power and superiority.

For example, the incorporation of dome structures in Iranian mosques can be
traced back to the impact of Byzantine architecture during the Islamic empire.
These domes became a symbol of power and authority, even though the design
was borrowed from another culture. Similarly, Parsi fire temples in India
showcase a mix of Persian and Indian architectural elements, signifying the
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merging of influences and the desire to retain their cultural identity despite being
in a new land.

The Role of Cultural Exchange

While the imperialism of the copy may initially appear as a negative concept, it is
essential to consider the positive aspects of cultural exchange and the cross-
pollination of architectural ideas. The adoption of foreign architectural styles does
not necessarily mean a loss of cultural identity but can often be viewed as a
means of cultural adaptation and reinterpretation.

Iranian and Parsi architecture serve as perfect examples of this, where the fusion
of diverse architectural elements has given birth to unique and captivating
designs. Through cultural exchange, both cultures have been able to incorporate
ideas and techniques that enhance their architectural traditions and contribute to
their identity.

Preserving Cultural Identity

Despite the influence of foreign architectural styles, Iranian and Parsi architecture
have managed to preserve their cultural identity through meticulous attention to
specific details and incorporation of symbolic motifs. Persian elements such as
intricate tile work, geometric patterns, and calligraphy are still prominent in Iranian
architecture, despite the impact of Byzantine and Islamic influences. Similarly,
Parsi architecture incorporates distinct features such as carved wooden brackets,
ornamental roofs, and symbolic representations, which differentiate it from
surrounding Indian styles.

Perpetuation of the Copy

In the contemporary world, the imperialism of the copy continues to influence
Iranian and Parsi architecture. Globalization and the ease of access to



architectural information have further blurred the boundaries between cultures.
Today, architects can draw inspiration from diverse architectural styles without
physical boundaries, leading to a perpetuation of the copy in architectural
designs.

However, this also opens up opportunities for creative exploration and the
development of innovative architectural expressions. By embracing the ongoing
dialogue between originality and imitation, these architectural styles can continue
to evolve and adapt while maintaining their unique cultural characteristics.

The imperialism of the copy in Iranian and Parsi architecture showcases the
complex relationship between originality, imitation, and cultural identity. Rather
than being solely seen as a negative or oppressive concept, the fusion of diverse
architectural elements has given rise to captivating architectural styles that
continue to thrive. The interplay between original ideas and the influence of
dominant cultures has enabled Iranian and Parsi architecture to adapt, preserve,
and assert their cultural identity in an ever-evolving global architectural
landscape.
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One of the most heated scholarly controversies of the early twentieth century, the
Orient-or-Rome debate turned on whether art historians should trace the origin of
all Western—and especially Gothic—architecture to Roman ingenuity or to the
Indo-Germanic Geist. Focusing on the discourses around this debate, Talinn
Grigor considers the Persian Revival movement in light of imperial strategies of
power and identity in British India and in Qajar-Pahlavi Iran.

The Persian Revival examines Europe’s discovery of ancient Iran, first in
literature and then in art history. Tracing Western visual discourse about ancient
Iran from 1699 on, Grigor parses the invention and use of a revivalist architectural
style from the Afsharid and Zand successors to the Safavid throne and the rise of
the Parsi industrialists as cosmopolitan subjects of British India. Drawing on a
wide range of Persian revival narratives bound to architectural history, Grigor
foregrounds the complexities and magnitude of artistic appropriations of Western
art history in order to grapple with colonial ambivalence and imperial aspirations.
She argues that while Western imperialism was instrumental in shaping high art
as mercantile-bourgeois ethos, it was also a project that destabilized the
hegemony of a Eurocentric historiography of taste.

An important reconsideration of the Persian Revival, this book will be of vital
interest to art and architectural historians and intellectual historians, particularly
those working in the areas of international modernism, Iranian studies, and
historiography.
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