
The Ultimate Guide to Army Regulation AR
600-22: Personnel–General Military Awards
(July 2019)

Every day, the brave men and women serving in the United States Army put their
lives on the line to protect our great nation. In recognition of their incredible
dedication and sacrifice, the Army issues various military awards to honor the
exceptional achievements and contributions made by its personnel. One of the
most significant references guiding these awards is the Army Regulation AR 600-
22. In this comprehensive guide, we will delve into the details of this regulation,
discover its importance, and explore the various military awards it covers. So,
let's dive in and unravel the world of Army Regulation AR 600-22!
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The Significance of Army Regulation AR 600-22

For soldiers and their families, Army Regulation AR 600-22 serves as an essential
resource. This regulation provides the framework for recognizing troops'
outstanding performance and displaying gratitude for their accomplishments and
sacrifices. It outlines the eligibility criteria, types of awards, nominations process,
and the hierarchy of awards within the army. Compliance with this regulation
ensures consistency, fairness, and transparency in the awarding of military
honors.
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Understanding the Contents of Army Regulation AR 600-22

Army Regulation AR 600-22 is divided into several chapters, each focusing on
different aspects of military awards.

Chapter 1:

This chapter provides a brief overview of the regulation, its purpose, and how it is
implemented within the army. It also explains the different types of awards
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covered within the regulation, ranging from personal decorations to unit awards.

Chapter 2: Authority for Awards

Here, we find detailed information about the authority responsible for approving
and presenting the military awards. It clarifies the roles and responsibilities of
various individuals within the Army personnel hierarchy.

Chapter 3: Award Approval Authorities

This section outlines the different levels of authority required for the approval of
each award. It explains the criteria for each approving authority and highlights the
respective award categories that fall under their purview.

Chapter 4: Award Limitations

Chapter 4 delves into the limitations surrounding the awarding of specific military
honors. It discusses the circumstances under which awards may be granted and
provides guidance on how to deal with exceptions to the general criteria.

Chapter 5: Award Processing

Here, we explore the step-by-step process of submitting award recommendations
for deserving individuals. It covers the required documents, timelines, and
procedures that must be followed to ensure the proper recognition of outstanding
achievements.

Chapter 6: Presentation of Awards

This chapter details the formalities involved in presenting military awards. It
explains the importance of ceremony and tradition in honoring the deserving
soldiers.

Chapter 7: Approval and Announcement



Chapter 7 focuses on the final stages of the award process, highlighting the
necessary approvals, authorization for wearing awards, and the public
announcement of recipients.

Army Regulation AR 600-22 plays a vital role in recognizing the exemplary
service, valor, and sacrifice of soldiers in the United States Army. This regulation
ensures that exceptional achievements do not go unnoticed and that the
deserving personnel receive the appropriate honors. It sets the standard for
military awards and defines the procedures to be followed throughout the
process.

If you or your loved ones serve in the army, understanding Army Regulation AR
600-22 is crucial to navigate the world of military awards and appreciate the
significance behind each honor bestowed upon our brave soldiers. With this
guide, you are now equipped with the knowledge to explore the intricate details of
Army Regulation AR 600-22 and share its vital information with others.
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This regulation, Army Regulation AR 600-8-22 Personnel-General: Military
Awards July 2019, provides Department of the Army policy, criteria, and
administrative instructions concerning individual military decorations, Army Good
Conduct Medals, service medals and ribbons, combat and special skill badges
and tabs, unit decorations, trophies, and similar devices awarded in recognition of
accomplishments. It prescribes the policies and procedures concerning U.S.
Army awards to foreign military personnel and foreign decorations to U.S. Army
personnel.This regulation applies to the Regular Army, the Army National
Guard/Army National Guard of the United States, and the U.S. Army Reserve,
unless otherwise stated. It also applies to retired military personnel of all
branches, foreign military personnel, and Department of Defense Civilians, as
indicated.
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