
Too Small Tola Atinuke - A Tale of Courage
and Determination
Once upon a time in the colorful city of Lagos, there lived a young girl named Tola
Atinuke. Tola was small for her age, but what she lacked in physical stature, she
made up for with her extraordinary courage and determination.

Tola's small size often made her the target of teasing and bullying from her peers.
They would call her names like "Tiny Tola" or "Little Ladybug." Despite the hurtful
words, Tola remained unperturbed. She believed in her abilities and refused to let
anyone's opinions define her.

At home, Tola's parents recognized her incredible spirit and supported her
dreams. They taught her about resilience and the power of self-belief. Tola would
spend hours reading books about brave heroes and heroines who faced
insurmountable challenges and emerged victorious.
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One day, while Tola was at the local library, she stumbled upon a book about a
young girl who fought against all odds to become a boxing champion. Inspired by
the story, Tola decided she wanted to take up boxing herself. She knew it would
not be easy to persuade her parents, but she was determined to make them see
her potential.

Tola started researching boxing gyms in Lagos and came across a small gym run
by a retired champion boxer. She convinced her parents to visit the gym, and
upon meeting the trainer and seeing Tola's passion, he agreed to coach her. And
so, Tola's boxing journey began.

Training was grueling for Tola, but she never complained. Instead, she pushed
herself harder each day, determined to prove that size does not determine one's
abilities. Her dedication and unwavering spirit caught the attention of her fellow
boxers and the trainer. They watched in awe as Tola sparred with opponents
twice her size and held her ground.

Word of Tola's incredible talent spread like wildfire in the boxing community. The
national boxing association heard about her and invited her to participate in the
upcoming national championship. It was a moment of triumph for the young girl
who had been belittled for her size. She knew this was her chance to prove to the
world that she was more than just "Too Small Tola."

The day of the championship arrived, and Tola stood in the ring, adrenaline
coursing through her veins. The crowd was skeptical, expecting her to be
overpowered by her bigger opponents. But Tola had a fire within her that could
not be extinguished. She fought with a determination that left everyone
mesmerized.



Round after round, Tola showcased her skills, landing powerful punches and
dodging her opponents' attacks with precision. Despite the odds stacked against
her, Tola emerged victorious, winning the championship belt that day. The crowd
erupted in applause, amazed by the resilience and courage displayed by this
small girl with a big heart.

Tola's story soon became an inspiration for many, not just in the boxing world, but
in all walks of life. Her triumph over adversity taught people that size is
inconsequential compared to the size of one's dreams and determination.

Years later, Tola Atinuke's name became synonymous with bravery. She went on
to become a mentor, guiding aspiring young boxers to unlock their full potential
and reminding them that anything is possible if they believe in themselves.

So, remember the tale of Too Small Tola Atinuke, the young girl who defeated
giants with her courage and determination. Let her story inspire you to chase your
dreams fearlessly, regardless of any obstacles that come your way.
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Three delightful tales from a renowned Nigerian storyteller introduce a chapter-
book heroine who is every bit as mighty as she is small.
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In a trio of droll stories, award-winning author and storyteller Atinuke debuts an
endearing and enduring character with plenty to prove. Tola lives in an apartment
in the busy city of Lagos, Nigeria, with her sister, Moji, who is very clever; her
brother, Dapo, who is very fast; and Grandmommy, who is very bossy. Tola may
be small, but she’s strong enough to carry a basket brimming with groceries
home from the market, and she’s clever enough to count out Grandmommy’s
change. When the faucets in the apartment break, it’s Tola who brings water from
the well. And when Mr. Abdul, the tailor, has an accident and needs help taking
his customers’ measurements, only Tola can save the day. Atinuke’s trademark
wit and charm are on full display, accompanied by delightful illustrations by
Onyinye Iwu. Too Small Tola evokes the urban bustle and rich blending of
cultures in Lagos through the eyes of a little girl with an outsize will—and an even
bigger heart.
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